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Villa Sale in Torrita di Siena (SI) strada provinciale dei renelli 2

Beautiful property in Tuscany
Property located in Tuscany, in the province of Siena, which extends over approximately 50 hectares divided between
fields, olive grove and woodland, swimming pools, as well as two independent cottages, about 300 metres from each
other and connected by a road that runs alongside the olive grove, which can also be travelled on foot.
The property, located in a dominant position on the hillside, overlooks the most picturesque and panoramic points of the
Val di Chiana, offering a wonderful, wide-ranging view of the historic villages, which are among the most important in
Tuscany. The first farmhouse, approx. 280 sqm, is immersed in the green of an enchanting Sienese hillside that enjoys
abundant and sweet tranquillity. It is divided into five independent flats with rustic-style furnishings, complete with kitchen,
and a large fenced garden and five reserved areas with table, chairs and sunshade. There is a covered parking area and
a 7 x 14 metre swimming pool with diving board, equipped with chairs, deckchairs and parasols, a mini-volleyball court
and a ping-pong table, table football, hammocks, an antique wood-burning oven and a barbecue. Each flat has a boiler
with LPG radiators. The second farmhouse, measuring approximately 195 square metres, is immersed in the greenery of
a very peaceful hillside, recently renovated, and surrounded by a large fenced area and a pine forest. It has a car park, an
infinity pool with a panoramic view and sun loungers and umbrellas, a table tennis table, table football, chairs, sofas,
wicker tables and finally also an equipped barbecue. The cottage is divided into 5 double rooms with new rustic-style
furnishings (each with bathroom and kitchen cupboard) with a large common room with table, sofa corner and TV,
fireplace, bar counter, fully equipped kitchen and a washing machine. It is equipped with satellite dish, mini fridge and
radiators.
On the first floor there is a terrace where you can enjoy the wonderful views that the farmhouse offers. Each flat has a
boiler with LPG radiators. There is also a 95 sqm stable, a photovoltaic system and an artificial lake. Tuscany is one of
the best known and most appreciated places by visitors from all over the world for its typical succession of unique
landscapes, characterised by gentle green hills, rich in dense woods, large expanses of vineyards and olive groves, small
villages, medieval castles and wineries where you can taste the best wines in the world.

INFORMATION
Ref. Toscana 082

Type Sale

Category Villa

Price 3,900,000.00

Annual Expense

Year

Energetic Class G 212.21

NUMBER
Rooms 14

Bedrooms 12

Bathrooms 13

Balconies + Terraces

Floor

Car Space

Box

SQUARE METERS
Commercial 600

Garden 500000

Cellar

Balconies + Terraces

Attic

Tavern

Box
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FEATURES

Property Conditions Renovated Rank Elegant View Open View

Orientation North West South East Free Sides 4 Garden Private

Heating Independent Heating Type Boiler Type of heating system Radiator heating

Energy source LPG Heating

ACCESSORIES

Fireplace Double entrance Photovoltaic system Laundry room Swimming pool

Data network Storage room Outdoor tables

IMAGES
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